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Shere Champions Are Sold’

HIPS 1-655

QUARTER HORSE

MAGAZINE FOR RUNNING QUARTER HORSES
Preliminary Sale Results 2013 HERITAGE PLACE FALL MIXED SALE November 1 & 2, 2013

Hip | Horse Price Birth Yr [ Sex Breeding Buyer State
1 Emory Just Like Me $2,700.00 | 12 F Bigtime Favorite-La Dokey Rona Manuel Martinez OK
2 Zoom Thru Fire 12 F Jess Zoomin-La Dominica Withdrawn OK
3 Lets Be First Prize $3,000.00 | 12 F First Prize Perry-Lets Foolum Ramon R Vega X
4 Enthrall $13,000.00 | 12 F PYC Paint Your Wagon-Lett Her Zoom Darling Farms Dan Darling OK
5 J Rye $8,500.00 [ 12 C Ivory James-Like Phoebe Jason & Leslie Willis SC
6 Playin Peekyboo $11,000.00 | 12 F Hawkinson-Kool Kue Chick Arturo de Anda
7 Fuzzy Navel $1,000.00 | 12 F Awesome Chrome-Mai Tais At Sunset Richard Clay OK
8 One Famous Girl $12,000.00 | 12 F One Famous Eagle-Makeala Aaron Harvey KS
9 Famous Eagle Down $17,500.00 | 12 C One Famous Eagle-Miss Rare First Down Rachuan Suarez MVZ VERACRUZ
10 Jumpn Contessa $8,500.00 | 12 F Jumpn-Miss Royal Baby Doll Cecil O Newberry AR
11 Live From Newyork To $2,500.00 | 12 C Papa Larry-Miss Truckle Sign Teodoro Delgado OK
12 Drag Racin $4,000.00 | 12 F Hawkinson-Mongoose Shake Em Enrigue Leon NE
13 Maximum Regard $10,500.00 | 12 C Chicks Regard-Moon Kissed Perry Jackie Kirby OK
14 The Forbidden City $7,500.00 | 12 C Brookstone Bay-Mr Perrys Wine Summer Run Inc Paul Luedemann MN
15 My Kuhl Choice $12,200.00 | 12 C A Regal Choice-My May Chick Ervey Montijo NM
16 Bringin The Gray $40,000.00 | 12 C Mr Jess Perry-None As Easy Sunset Well Service, Inc. X
17 SV Honeys Success $2,800.00 | 12 F Cartel Success-Oh Honey Hush Felipe Martinez OK
18 Finding Silk 12 C Finding Nemo-Painted Silk Withdrawn MO
19 Momma Left Me $800.00 | 12 F Tres Fortunes-Pelirrojo s Frank Dena X
20 ASR Plain Jane $500.00 | 12 F Viperous-Peppermint Soda Pop Hector Valencia X
21 Wagon Runnin Loose $15,000.00 | 12 S PYC Paint Your Wagon-Post Oak Jane lvan Hernandez Ortega AZ
22 Mighty Dispatch $4,000.00 | 12 F Mighty Invictus-Rapid Dispatch Mark Williams OK
23 Canyon Lake 12 C Jet Black Patriot-Roll The Hardways Withdrawn X
24 Royal Papa Roxie $1,200.00 | 12 F Papa Larry-Royal Quick Playmate s Frank Dena TX
25 A Land Shark $8,000.00 | 12 C Hawkinson-Ruidosa Manuel Mata NE
26 Apolitical Victory $17,000.00 | 12 F Apollitical Jess-Runaway Dee Dee Richard Clay OK
27 Thats Lame Sauce Man 12 F Wave Carver-Ryons Blazer Withdrawn CcO
28 Inseperable Angel $1,200.00 | 12 F Inseperable-Sage Is A Lady Hector Valencia TX
29 Jazzi Bonuz $1,100.00 | 12 F Bono Jazz-Sandhya Alfredo Gomez X
30 Paint My Ride $5,700.00 | 12 F PYC Paint Your Wagon-Saturday Nite Ride Victor Flores OK
31 Moneystetcher $10,000.00 | 12 G Heza Fast Dash-Sayin Together Ralph Young MT
32 So Into You $35,000.00 | 12 F Qak Tree Special-Send Me The Candy Repurchase TX
33 Com Callin $4,000.00 | 12 F Volcom-Shady Caller Hector Estrada OK




34 Dolls Got The Wave $12,500.00 | 12 F Wave Carver-Shazooms Doll Hector Estrada OK
35 Hesa Winning Mystery 12 G Mr Queens Mystery-Shesa Winning Flight Withdrawn X
Rocking Diamond Quarter Horse Ranch

36 Bigtime Folly $10,500.00 | 12 F Bigtime Favorite-Sixes Folly Randy D. or Sharlene Lynn Reuer ND
37 Amirza $2,000.00 | 12 F Mezoomin-Smash The Form Luis Miguel Albores Gleason FL
38 Holler At A Hero $7,200.00 | 12 C Valiant Hero-Snow Burn Val Gonzalez TX
39 Eyema Southern Gent $11,000.00 | 12 C Mr Eye Opener-Southern Brook Ramon Escamilla KY
40 Tiny Bit Of Baja $2,000.00 | 12 G Tinys First Corona-Speeding Thru Baja Edward Gonzalez TX
41 Star Spangled Banner $700.00 | 12 C Awesome Chrome-Star Trace Hector Valencia X
42 Six Fights $5,000.00 | 12 F Fighter On Fire-Starsmith Repurchase NM
43 Fitipaldi $4,800.00 | 12 C Country Quick Dash-Stolified Gregg Sanders OK
44 Foxy Sign $1,600.00 | 12 F First Class Sign-Stone Cold Fox Eddie Webb IN
45 Big Time Bigs $8,800.00 | 12 C Bigtime Favorite-Sweethearts Quicksix Mario H. Vazquez NL
46 Dovelyist $3,700.00 | 12 F Separatist-The Dove Priscilla Rodrigues X
47 Cucinelli $13,000.00 | 12 F Bigtime Favorite-Tiny First Down Darling Farms Dan Darling OK
48 Shesa Comin $7,000.00 | 12 F Separatist-To Catch A Fly Raymond Petty AR
49 Catch This TR $4,000.00 | 12 F TR Dasher-To Catch A Fly Val Gonzalez TX
50 Fly By Perry $8,000.00 | 09 G First Prize Perry-Too Revealing Scott Friesenhahn X
51 Regard Tres $26,000.00 | 12 F Chicks Regard-Tres Cartel Victor W Pryor Jr OK
52 Mac Turner Loose 12 F Macs Gold Texan-Turner Loose Withdrawn OK
53 Awesome Sauce $1,700.00 | 12 C Awesome Chrome-Two Cents Worth Dishman, Billy/Razorback Ranch OK
54 Jess As Sexy $3,000.00 | 12 F Jess A Chicks-Uncommonly Sexy Marty &/or Shalia Powers OK
55 Dash Kicker $16,000.00 | 12 C Mr Jess Perry-Vikes Dashing Rebeca Lozoya X
56 Vital Temp B%B F Tempting Dash-Vital Time Withdrawn X
57 Wut The $3,500.00 | 12 G First Class Sign-A Classic Diamond Luis F Martinez X
58 Wavin Smoke $4,500.00 [ 12 F Wave Carver-A Little Storm Joe Rios X
59 A Smashing First Down $600.00 | 12 F First Down Straw-A Smashing Babe Hector Valencia X
60 Yolandas Memory 12 F Volcom-Ali Cartel Withdrawn NM
61 Embolden $18,000.00 | 12 C Coronas Fast Dash-All About Ease Marty Powers, Agent OK
62 Tempting Dashforcash $19,000.00 | 12 C Tempting Dash-Allamericandreamgirl Repurchase uT
63 Dreamgirl On Fire $35,000.00 | 12 F Walk Thru Fire-Allamericandreamgirl Tom Maher / Summer Run Inc. MN
64 Jess A Laddie $950.00 [ 12 G First Down Mr Jess-An Oakee Lassie Joe Rios X
65 UC Me Naked $5,500.00 [ 12 F Tac It Like A Man-As Blazin Goes C A Cofer KS
66 Miss Sterling Regard $9,000.00 | 12 F Chicks Regard-BCR Really A Doll Aaron Harvey KS
67 Dino Dan $2,200.00 | 12 G Lonestar Legend-Behold A Zowie Havid Canez AZ
68 Unnamed Yearling $0.00 | 12 F Viperous-Bid In Roses No Bid OK
69 Apollitical Chick $3,800.00 | 12 F Chicks Regard-Blazin Apollo One Repurchase MN
70 A First Class Party $3,200.00 | 12 F First Class Sign-Blitz Cash Carlos Nieto X
71 Never Got Paid $1,000.00 | 12 C Raise A Jet-Boonsville Dream Walter Hanibal Jr. OK
72 Arrack $10,000.00 | 12 C Ocean Runaway-Brava Brava Rachuan Suarez MVZ VERACRUZ




73 Wooden Peaches $6,000.00 | 12 F Woodbridge-Bullet Bullion Vincent P Genco CA
74 Gone By $7,000.00 | 12 F Hawkinson-By Gone Ed Melzer OK
75 Little Bigfoot $2,000.00 | 12 G Lonestar Legend-Carols Treasure Jesse Godinez CA
76 Remi Martin 12 C Volcom-Checkuponit Withdrawn OK
77 Sucha Corona $1,700.00 | 12 F Suchanimage-Corona Deere Jaime Longoria TX
78 Corona Temp 12 C Tempting Dash-Corona Seis Withdrawn X
79 Tempting To Dash 12 C Tempting Dash-Corona Valentine Withdrawn X
80 Encourage 12 C Captain Courage-Cowgirl Cartel Withdrawn TX
81 RP Moon Light $4,000.00 | 12 C Carters Cartel-CS Night Light Priscilla Rodrigues X
82 Galla Spirit $1,300.00 | 12 F Zippem-Dance In The Rain Repurchase CO
83 Cheyenne Woman $20,500.00 | 12 F PYC Paint Your Wagon-Dash Ta Spend Raymond Merrill OK
83A [ On The Wagon $27,000.00 | 12 C PYC Paint Your Wagon-Xo Kate Isidro Flores X
84 Won Bad Cat $7,000.00 | 12 C Red Storm Cat-Dashin Bayou Baby Steven M. Gore TN
85 Dashs Sooner Babe $3,000.00 | 12 F Furyofthewind-Dashs Perfection Dishman, Billy/Razorback Ranch OK
86 Deal On The Fly $2,200.00 | 12 C Fly Jess Fly-Dealasix Misael Leon IL
87 JLS Rebs Eye Opener $14,700.00 | 12 F Mr Eye Opener-Do It To It Reb Luis Villa Franco OK
88 Unnamed Yearling $2,500.00 | 12 G Okey Dokey Dale-Evelyn M Repurchase TX
89 Sixes Corona Feather $43,000.00 | 12 C Corona Cartel-Eye For The Sixes George Wilcox AR
90 Bay Eagle Glory $25,000.00 | 12 C One Famous Eagle-Eye Of Glory Jerry Galvan TX
91 Eye Aint No Girl $22,000.00 | 12 F Inseperable-Eyema Blues Girl Ed Melzer OK
92 Jed Eye Warrior $45,000.00 | 12 G PYC Paint Your Wagon-Eyes Required Ed Melzer OK
93 Chappstick $6,000.00 | 11 G Swissle Stick-Famous Chapelle Two Fat Ranch TX
94 Thats My Daughter $38,000.00 | 12 F Corona Cartel-Famous Phoebe Mike Castanon X
95 BP Fast Mans Success $9,500.00 | 12 F Cartel Success-Fast Mans Money Repurchase OK
96 CR Tamarisk 12 F Valiant Hero-Ferarri Fast Prize Withdrawn GA
97 One Famous Moon $16,000.00 | 12 F One Famous Eagle-First Moon Risen Val Gonzalez TX
98 Eyesasita $2,500.00 | 12 F Pappasito-First Place Eyesa Juan Lopez X
99 Lifestyle Change $1,600.00 | 12 G Lonestar Legend-First Place Pass Havid Canez AZ
100 [ First Down Ivory $7,000.00 | 12 F Ivory James-Firsts Lady Caartel Pedro P Mena

101 | No Secret Love $8,000.00 | 12 F No Secrets Here-Floribunda Jaime Amaya AR
102 [ Ivory Bonus $22,000.00 | 12 C Ivory James-Fly Bonus Jose Arturo Manzanera TX
103 [ Fantastic Flier $8,200.00 | 12 C Fantastic Corona Jr-Flyin Grey Goose Enrigue Carrion TX
104 | Funny Munny $8,500.00 | 12 C Munnings-Fodice Rancho Hacienda Santiago GTO
105 [ Run By You 12 F Apollitical Jess-Fovee Withdrawn KY
106 | Freck Less Ambition $600.00 | 12 F Zippem-Freckles Rose Dishman, Billy/Razorback Ranch OK
107 [ Freedonia $7,000.00 | 12 F Ivory James-Free Bird Fly Jesse Godinez CA
108 [ Macs Farm Lady $1,400.00 | 12 F Macs Gold Winner-Funny Farm Repurchase OK
109 | Get Your Grip On $1,000.00 | 12 F Country Quick Dash-Get A Grip (APHA) Dishman, Billy/Razorback Ranch OK
110 [ Cruisen $7,400.00 | 12 C Heza Motor Scooter-Girls Rock Repurchase AZ




111 [ Chicks Win $1,300.00 | 12 F Winners Award-Gray Sparkling Chick Hector Valencia TX
112 | Devons Shake Em $3,000.00 | 12 C Devons Signature-GW Tiny Tiger Ramon Pizana TX
113 [ Stolis Aria 12 C Stoli-Heavenly Note Withdrawn X
114 | SV Ronas Success $1,900.00 | 12 C Cartel Success-High Density Marciano LeChuga TX
115 | Six In The Snow $1,200.00 | 12 F Snowbound-Hinds Feet Hegg Ranch NL
116 [ Cierra Jade $5,700.00 | 12 F Red Storm Cat-Ho Lotta Speed Repurchase OK
117 | Ima Runnin Eagle $7,500.00 | 12 C One Famous Eagle-Ima Runnin Hussy Misael Leon IL
118 | Abu Dasher $6,700.00 | 12 C TR Dasher-Inquiring Mind Ramon Pizana X
119 [ Trick Ponie $2,200.00 | 12 C Dejon-Its A Dry Heat Jerome Bellard LA
120 [ Smokn On Bye $1,200.00 | 12 G Afrashad-lza Flyin Bye Jean Dillard OK
121 | Mr Bigtime Jess $29,000.00 | 12 C Bigtime Favorite-Jess Cranky Repurchase X
122 | Jewel Time $2,400.00 | 12 G Awesome Chrome-Judys Jewel Repurchase X
123 [ Cowboy Mafia $3,200.00 | 12 G Judys Lineage-Just Streakin Ralph Young MT
124 | My Inamorata $12,000.00 | 02 M First Down Dash-Dela Cream Smash Bill or Debbie Myers SD
125 | Fabiana $6,500.00 | 04 M Strawfly Special-Fashionisanattitude Joaquin Lopez TX
126 | Imagine If $8,500.00 | 02 M Strawfly Special-Miss Eye Opener C/C Stock Farm OK
127 | Addicting Allure $7,000.00 | 97 M Reckless Dash-Southern Streaker Ramon Escamilla KY
128 [ Simplifly $4,200.00 | 00 M Strawfly Special-Dash Again Johnny Sanchez

129 | Grace Gone Wild $16,000.00 | 09 M Valiant Hero-Thrill And Grace Evans & Evans X
130 [ Familiar Faces $8,500.00 | 97 M Special Effort-Miss Eye Opener Connie Nobles X
131 | Meteora $3,000.00 | 07 M Special Leader-Vertical Horizon Copper Spring Ranch MONTANA
132 | Effortless Preference $5,700.00 | 00 M First Down Dash-Effortless Dream Connie Nobles X
133 [ Eyesaspecial Fashion $3,000.00 | 04 S Eyesa Special-Fashionisanattitude Blowing W Ranch OK
134 | Hoochie Mama $2,000.00 | 10 F Reckless Dash-Her Hearts Desire Tom Lovell VA
135 | ltsallaboutattitude $3,000.00 | 10 F No Secrets Here-Fashionisanattitude Post Oak Farms X
136 | Cosmo Time $7,000.00 | 10 F Stoli-Shades Of Perfection Terry Albracht TX
137 [ Dress Accordingly $2,700.00 | 09 M Eyesaspecial Fashion-Its Called Class Blowing W Ranch OK
138 | Honorable Flame $1,500.00 | 00 M Honorable Obsession-Flametta Bar Rice, Larry or Michelle/Flag Ranch NE
139 | Daring Deception $3,500.00 | 97 M Special Effort-Daring Difference Ramon Escamilla KY
140 [ Jacqulien $2,500.00 | 11 F Eyesaspecial Fashion-My Inamorata Bob Daily OK
141 | Visions N Traditions $2,200.00 | 10 F Visionarian-Effortless Dream Post Oak Farms TX
142 | Dazzeling $2,200.00 | 11 F Eyesaspecial Fashion-Razzebedazz Tom Lovell VA
143 | Dela Cream Dash $2,000.00 | 92 M Dash For Cash-Dela Cream Smash Erin Chrisman Goings NE
144 | Jet Black Alikat $5,000.00 | 11 G Jet Black Patriot-Stoli Alikat Valentin R Luna TN
145 | Jezebel Gone $4,000.00 | 10 F Walk Thru Fire-Sr Venus Delight Ramon Escamilla KY
146 | Treasures Jet $4,000.00 | 10 G Jet Cartel-Treasures Forever Brenda Fechner OK
147 | Divine Patriot $2,700.00 | 09 M Game Patriot-Stormie Dot Com Bielau Oaks TX
148 | Six Royal Alibis $10,500.00 | 07 M Sixes Royal-Dashing All Alibis (Foose) D & S Racing, LLC MS
149 | Mexican Radio $20,000.00 | 00 M On A High-Secret Meeting (FDD Dynasty) Kelly, James/Lazy E Ranch AZ




Lucky Aces N Eights-Sparkle Sparkle (Divide The

150 | Turn N Ace $1,900.00 | 97 M Cash) Sharin Hall OK
151 [ Lady Oceana $3,000.00 | 10 F Ocean Runaway-Especially Tricky Hegg Ranch NL
152 | First Prize Beach $3,000.00 | 11 F First Prize Perry-Private Beach Laurie A Ferguson AB
153 | Im Menace Fast $2,500.00 | 09 M Executive Menace-Im Color Fast Hector Valencia X
154 [ Fly This Wagon $8,000.00 | 09 M PYC Paint Your Wagon-To Catch A Fly (Separatist) Tom Scheckel 1A
155 | In The Starz $1,200.00 | 08 M Brimmerton-Sizzling (Desirio) Dishman, Billy/Razorback Ranch OK
Likenothinyoueversaw-Jonies Ruler (Specially
156 | Uneversawmecoming $900.00 | 05 M Alluring) Dixie Hinkle X
157 | Ketel Won $74,000.00 | 03 S Stoli-Sixy Lady Repurchase GA
158 | Jaguar Cat $0.00 | 04 M Whirling Fastball-Runaway Katie No Bid OH
SF Royal Quick Flash-Dash Olene Too (Capo de
159 | MT Dash Olene $3,000.00 | 01 M Capi) Joe Merrick OK
160 [ Klitschko $3,700.00 | 08 G Hawkinson-Pretty Jet High Repurchase CA
161 [ NN Absolutley $3,700.00 | 10 G Tres Seis-Absolut Stoli Casey Crowther FL
162 | French Twist $2,200.00 | 98 M Capitalimprovement-Blue Note (Stoli) Donnie Bearden OK
Edwards, Brandon/Herrick, John/Young,
163 [ Coronas Prospect $80,000.00 | 00 S Corona Cartel-Fantastic Polly Connie MO
164 [ Confession Session $1,000.00 | 07 M Sixes Royal-Daring Deception Rice, Larry or Michelle/Flag Ranch NE
165 | Feminine Feline $3,700.00 | 07 M Relagate-DC Patti Cat (Favorite Cartel) Salome Gallegos
166 [ Jess Moon Risen $10,000.00 | 10 F Mr Jess Perry-First Moon Risen Debra Laney NM
167 | Fire In The Tank $5,000.00 | 04 M Fishers Dash-Desert Orchid (Deal A Game) Repurchase TX
168 [ R Ladys Hero $1,500.00 | 11 G Valiant Hero-Texas Lady Passion Hector Valencia X
169 | Sixes Showtime $8,500.00 | 10 F Mr Jess Perry-JC Showtime Misael Leon IL
170 | Really Valiant $5,000.00 | 11 C Valiant Hero-Really A Diva Enrique Leon NE
171 | Foal In Utero $16,000.00 g%B U One Famous Eagle-Painted Silk Royal Vista Ranches, LLC OK
172 | This Chicks Buff $12,000.00 | 05 M Copper Buff-Free Range Chick (Carters Cartel) Larry L. Rice NE
173 | BV Eye Am Ridin Easy $2,700.00 | 09 G Mr Eye Opener-Easy Ridin Chick Hector Valencia X
174 | Sereni Tea Rose $40,000.00 | 09 M First Down Dash-St Pats Tea Scott & Monica Jones TX
175 | Tempting Dash $1,700,000.00 | 07 S First Down Dash-A Tempting Chick John Simmons TX
176 | Crisp $0.00 | 10 F No Secrets Here-Specialy Double Withdrawn NM
177 | Joeys Spit Curl $3,500.00 | 10 G Spit Curl Jess-Sipes Magic Breeze Kendal Owen OK
178 [ Pappys Prince $2,200.00 | 10 G Pappasito-Stawfly N Princess Repurchase OK
179 | Special Debonair $6,500.00 | 04 M Eyesa Special-Debonairess (Valiant Hero) QH Investments, LLC OK
180 [ A Wholelotta Bling $11,500.00 | 07 M Dash Ta Fame-Hopeful Imp Joe Rios X
181 [ Drill Baby Drill $8,000.00 | 08 G Gold Medal Jess-Lady Dee Vee Em Felipe Martinez OK
Country Chicks Man-First A Princess (Duke
182 | In Vino Veritas $2,000.00 | 09 M Kahanamoku) Repurchase CA
183 [ Austinista $2,800.00 | 10 F Dashin Bye-Austiana Terry Moody SD
184 | Igotyourtac $30,000.00 | 09 S Tac It Like A Man-Budderfly Effect ZACH STEVENSON X
185 | Mr Piloto $85,000.00 | 08 C Mr Jess Perry-Ms Pilot Point Grant Farms, LLC LA
186 [ Rain Maiden $2,000.00 | 98 C Royal Quick Dash-All American Beauty Jose Rodriguez X




187 | Regal Appeal $6,000.00 | 10 C Tres Seis-A First Down Corona Brenda Fechner OK
188 | Slew Creek $2,000.00 | 11 G Chickie Cherry Cola-Ought To Be Fabulous Priscilla Rodrigues TX
189 [ Madd Dog $4,500.00 | 10 G Dog Daze Afternoon-Merri Roc Jackie Kirby OK
190 | Stayin On Task $2,200.00 | 98 M Special Task-Impressa (Okey Dokey Dale) Bill Loewen MEX
191 [ Pumpkinson 03 M Hawkinson-Jennies Pumpkin Withdrawn NM
192 | Sheza Chapelle $550.00 | 06 M Heza Bold Man-Love That Chapelle Brittney Lilly X
193 [ Effortless Shazoom 10 F Shazoom-Tiny First Effort Withdrawn TX
194 [ SV Hushed Cartel $1,700.00 | 13 F Cartel Success-Oh Honey Hush Jeff Strange TX
195 [ Do Not Temp Me $50,000.00 | 11 C First Down Dash-A Tempting Chick Filimon Saucedo X
196 [ Miss Perry Gold $19,000.00 | 11 F Mr Jess Perry-The Will To Go On Repurchase TX
197 | Bobbies Chico $2,500.00 | 08 M Dashin Chico-Reckless Storm Nobie E. Hudson OK
198 | Royal Ocean Goddess $10,500.00 | 08 M Ocean Runaway-Time For A Goddess (Teller Cartel) [ Robicheaux Ranch, Inc. LA
Takin On The Cash-Lil Bit Rusty (One Famous
199 | Babyigotchamoney $15,500.00 | 01 M Eagle) Marshall S Wier NE
200 [ Last Chance Lily $1,700.00 | 09 M Favorite Trick-Oo The Possibilities (Wave Carver) Donnie Bearden OK
201 | How Lucky Am | $3,700.00 | 11 F Okey Dokey Dale-Hy Lucky Corona Carlos Nieto X
202 [ Bigtime Blusher $1,300.00 | 11 G Bigtime Favorite-Blush Of Pink W Wesley Humphries VA
203 [ A Deadly Chick $6,700.00 | 02 M Chicks Beduino-A Femme Fatale (Volcom) Ramon R Vega X
204 | Azyoucansee $27,500.00 | 00 S First Down Dash-Azures Cash Salvador Pimienta, Agent AZ
205 | Dashin Follies $250,000.00 | 99 M Strawfly Special-Dashing Folly Vincent P Genco CA
206 | Foal In Utero $100,000.00 ggB U Corona Cartel-Dashin Follies Mike & Mary Ellen Hickman OK
207 [ Toast Of Chalis $2,500.00 | 00 M Toast To Dash-Chabin (High Rate Of Return) Repurchase X
208 | Clancey $4,000.00 | 09 G Hawkinson-Dashing Wagon Jackie Kirby OK
209 | Primero $7,500.00 | 11 G Toast To Dash-Tiny First Effort Cindy Dick NM
210 | Coronas Black Curls $5,000.00 | 11 F Spit Curl Jess-First Prize Corona D & S Racing, LLC MS
211 | Its My Brimmerton 11 C Brimmerton-ltsmybag Withdrawn OK
212 | Jesses Allstar 11 G Jesse James Jr-Starsmith Withdrawn X
No Country Chicks Man-First Prize Dash (Spit Curl
213 | First Prize Chic DOB M Jess) Withdrawn OK
214 | Kiss Me Im Famous $6,000.00 | 10 G One Famous Eagle-Awesome Blossom Joe Rios X
215 [ Harsh Times 11 F Jess Zoomin-Classic Cartel Withdrawn LA
216 | Jess Thats Blazin $6,500.00 | 10 G Swingin Jess-Sure Thats Blazin Jaime Martinez OK
217 | Separate Fire $460,000.00 | 09 M Walk Thru Fire-Septacular McCollee Land & Livestock uT
218 | Foal In Utero $125,000.00 g(())B U Mr Jess Perry-Separate Fire Judy McDonald X
219 | Foal In Utero $150,000.00 g(())B U Corona Cartel-Separate Fire Judy McDonald TX
220 | Foal In Utero $183,000.00 ggB ] Corona Cartel-Separate Fire Judy McDonald X
221 | True Jean $8,000.00 | 05 M Yes lts True-Jean Beebe (Captain Courage) Rusty Roberts OK
222 | Elecandalo $1,600.00 | 08 G Sunsets Last Sunrise-lcey Opener Javier Chavez NM
223 | Texan Hero 10 M Valiant Hero-High Kicking Gal (Jesse James Jr) Withdrawn NM




224 | Smarty Leigh Perry $3,800.00 | 03 M Jazzing High-Miss Frugal (Jess Zoomin) Leigh Letinski LA
Touch Gold-Zealous Connection (Duke

225 [ Frequent Flyer $3,200.00 | 06 M Kahanamoku) Scott Pierce OK
226 | My Little Goodbye $5,000.00 | 00 M Heza Fast Man-Bye Bye Imgone (Jet Black Patriot) Renee E. Spiller TX
227 [ One Sweet Oak $3,700.00 | 11 F Oak Tree Special-One Sweet Cookie Renee E. Spiller TX
228 | Frans Hero $15,000.00 | 11 F Valiant Hero-Going Seperate Ways Cindy Dick NM
229 | Foal In Utero $11,000.00 ggB ] Tempting Dash-Silver Tongued Chick Joe Rios X
230 | Foal In Utero $1,700.00 g(())B U Wave Carver-Silky Oak Alejandro Valadez IL

231 | Royal Rockin $2,000.00 | 98 M Royal Sovereign-Rocking Forth (Jodys Money Pop) Repurchase X
232 | Honey Dance Me Loose $2,700.00 | 02 M Striking Distance-Oh Honey Hush Todd Freeman TX
233 [ Foal In Utero $2,500.00 g%B U Wave Carver-Dicey Riley Repurchase CA
234 | Ivorys Special Lady $4,000.00 | 10 F Ivory James-Special Moon Beam Ramon Escamilla KY
235 | Mr Perry Diamond $5,500.00 | 11 G Mr Jess Perry-Diamonds Royalty Samuel Molina Quirarte IN

236 | Tac Of The Town $4,200.00 | 09 CNEaner Tac It Like A Man-Shes A Strawfly Alfredo Gomez TX
237 [ Teller She Can $11,500.00 | 11 F Teller Cartel-Buckshot Delight Darling Farms Dan Darling OK
238 | Dashin In Full Moon $9,500.00 | 11 F First Moonflash-Thatbeatsall Virginia Webber KS
239 | Firebawl $3,500.00 | 11 F Jess Zoomin-Jess A Lil Bit Randy Haffner IN

240 | Smithys A Good Time $1,300.00 | 10 F QOcean Runaway-JC Showtime Myrl Alan Tibbitts TX
241 [ Tiny Dash Of Bling $3,000.00 | 11 F Tinys First Corona-Country Eyeopener West Wind Qilfield Services Alex Kirkpatric | AB
242 | Riff Ta Fame $32,000.00 | 04 M Dash Ta Fame-Dashin Sandy (Big Daddy Cartel) Bee Silva TX
243 | Little Larkin Lil 95 M Special Effort-Paula Lark (Executive Menace) Withdrawn OK
244 | Ms Mighty Adorable $3,200.00 | 11 F Mighty Invictus-Adorable Deer Scott Oliver SC
245 | Eye Catcher 123 $5,500.00 | 03 M Mr Eye Opener-Very Striking (Whathaveigottado) Javier Lara KS
246 | Corona Bayou $1,700.00 | 11 G The Corona-Flash Bayou Lynn Rollings SC
247 [ Dancing Holland 08 M Holland Ease-Dancing Turf Withdrawn OK
248 | Bay Of Campeche $1,500.00 | 11 G Brookstone Bay-Quick Lee Gayle Dishman, Billy/Razorback Ranch OK
249 [ Angels Envy $27,000.00 | 10 F Mr Jess Perry-Strawberry Dash The Mixer Ranch OK
250 | One Corona $29,000.00 | 03 S Strawfly Special-Corona Cash Tom Jones WY
251 | Total Team $7,000.00 | 10 G Corona For Me-Oh Whatta Knockout Brenda Fechner OK
252 | Shes Wet N Wild $10,000.00 | 11 F Corona Cartel-Royalista Tom E Smith OK
253 | Forgive My Sin $3,000.00 | 11 C Game Patriot-Sin Tacha Perry Bill McClaran TX
254 | Star Over Utah $9,000.00 | 08 M Separatist-Quiet Courage (FDD Dynasty) Art Schultz LA
255 | Sixy De Cash $2,700.00 | 95 M Six Fortunes-Cash Arrangement Jose Rodriguez X
256 [ Katies Sign $7,500.00 | 00 M Vital Sign-Runaway Kate (Hard Hitting) Alvin Lee Turner X
257 | Eyesa Special Doll $5,700.00 | 03 M Eyesa Special-Mighty B Doll (Spit Curl Jess) Cindy Dick NM
258 [ Class Jump $40,000.00 | 10 C Corona Cartel-Jumping Tac Flash John Trajillo uT
259 | Bahama U Mama $11,000.00 | 11 F Ivory James-Baja Rosa Jackie Kirby OK
260 | Crown Royal Ice $1,100.00 | 10 F Thors Bullion-GW Tiny Tiger Gary Aichele WA




261 | One Eyed Eagle $25,500.00 | 10 F One Famous Eagle-Show Me Delight Post Oak Farms TX
262 | Oh Say Ok $650.00 | 02 M Notable Cat-Oh Say Madonna (Rolls Of Romance) Gary Hess PA
263 [ First Down Toll 02 M First Down Dash-Summer Tell Withdrawn CA
Get Down Perry-Famous Phoebe (DMNV
264 [ Freebe Phoebe 08 M Mountable) Withdrawn CO
265 | Checknbac $25,000.00 | 04 M Check Him Out-Running Bac (One Famous Eagle) Repurchase MO
266 | Prepare To Launch $2,200.00 | 10 F Separatist-Mimi Scooter Pedro P Mena
267 | Wagon Empire $13,000.00 | 09 G PYC Paint Your Wagon-Royalnative Empress Flying H Farms - Bob Hardy X
268 | Rock Zar $3,700.00 | 09 G Sweet First Down-Rock The Mall Oscar Padilla OK
269 | Cantcatchthissecret $15,000.00 | 11 F No Secrets Here-Lizas Mystique John S Wilson ONT
270 | Big Fisher $3,500.00 | 99 M Fishers Dash-Oh Whitney (Inseperable) Hubert Pilling OK
271 [ Pressanon $3,200.00 | 98 M Mr Eye Opener-Folsanon (Swissle Stick) Pedro P Mena
272 | Get Carter $3,900.00 | 10 G Carters Cartel-Ladies N Jens Gregg Sanders OK
273 | Mighty Invictus $78,000.00 | 02 S Mr Jess Perry-Mighty B Doll Enrigue Carrion X
A Streak Of Cash-Miss Bold Hope (Okey Dokey
274 | Streakin Hope $2,300.00 | 98 M Dale) Renee E. Spiller TX
275 | Special Entery $2,500.00 | 96 M Special Effort-Go Easy Smith (Azoom) Ramon Escamilla KY
276 [ Hot Dashing Doll $4,000.00 | 11 F Corona Caliente-Baby Doll Dash ZACH STEVENSON TX
277 | Iron Silk $500.00 | 10 F Afrashad-RG Stoli Kiss Brittney Lilly TX
278 | BP Snowy Success $12,000.00 | 10 F Cartel Success-A Snowy Fling Mike Abraham NM
279 [ Candy Sweet Dream $2,000.00 | 99 M Proudest Effort-Sweet Dynasty (Toast To Dash) Max Langlinais LA
280 | Hez An Okie $3,500.00 | 11 G Okey Dokey Dale-Eyes Tricky Too Adrian Cano KS
281 [ Awesome Sign $1,500.00 | 10 C Awesome Chrome-Sign Of Indian Jason & Leslie Willis SC
Runaway Winner-Deal In Vikingson (High Rate Of
282 [ Excellent Deal $3,200.00 | 97 M Return) Repurchase X
283 | A Runnin Ballerina $1,300.00 | 99 M Sixarun-Hadifs Ballerina Darrel Henry MO
284 [ Okey Dokey Fantasy $30,000.00 | 04 S Okey Dokey Dale-Fontanas Fantasy Riley Blanchet LA
285 | Whatsleftofwallst $2,000.00 | 10 G Finding Nemo-Wicked Azoom Rogers Sam OK
286 | Easy As Fishin $3,600.00 | 02 M Fishers Dash-Easy To Use (Pappasito) Darrel Henry MO
287 | Kellys Jewel $950.00 | 97 M Magic Dozen-Kellys Charm Dishman, Billy/Razorback Ranch OK
288 [ Striden Royal $3,200.00 | 10 G Stoli-Royal Delphias Chick Calvin Ghost Bear SD
Corona Cartel-La Gaviota De Seis (Oak Tree
289 [ Corona Seis 01 M Special) Withdrawn X
290 | MS Sugarbush $500.00 | 06 M Separatist-Protea Hans Peterson uT
291 | Suite Dreams $8,700.00 | 11 F Carters Cartel-Christie Jo Dash Repurchase TX
292 | Last Loose Perry $7,000.00 | 10 G Mr Jess Perry-Loose Lips Valentin R Luna TN
293 [ Corona Rosie $11,000.00 | 01 M Corona Cartel-A Streakin Rose (Giorgino) Copper Spring Ranch MONTANA
294 | Montelucia $30,000.00 | 11 F Mr Jess Perry-Sizzling Lola Vincent P Genco CA
295 [ Shesmine N Shesroyal $1,200.00 | 98 M Royal Quick Dash-Make Mine Easy Renee E. Spiller X
296 [ Adios La Glance $3,200.00 | 07 M Streakin La Jolla-A Third Glance David Hoxeng SD
297 | Noble Wave $2,500.00 | 09 G Wave Carver-Jetajing Ramon Pizana X
298 | Miss Mitos Whiskey $18,500.00 | 10 F Dash Ta Fame-Miss Mito Whiskey Darling Farms Dan Darling OK




299 | Babes Bac $3,300.00 | 03 M Splash Bac-Ajs Babe (Coronas Fast Dash) Repurchase KS
300 [ BV Stoli Easy $3,000.00 | 10 G Stoli-Easy Ridin Chick Jane Griffin OK
301 | Shez Jess Sweet 13 F One Sweet Jess-Send Me The Candy Withdrawn X
302 | Ms Go Went Gone 10 F Looks Royal-Ms Appropriations Withdrawn OK
303 | Miss Razzy Chick $500.00 | 00 M Ronas Ryon-Chicks Got Pazazz Darrel Henry MO
304 | By Gone $8,000.00 | 99 M Treasured-Blushing By (Favorite Cartel) Jorge Haddad X
305 [ Oak Trees Princess $2,300.00 | 10 F Oak Tree Special-Sha Cha Johnny Sanchez
306 | Rapid TR $1,200.00 | 11 F TR Dasher-Rapid Dispatch George Temple X
307 | Eye N Your Date $2,700.00 | 11 G Mr Eye Opener-Dirt Track Date Martin Peralta OK
308 | Barbie Kool $3,000.00 | 11 F Snowbound-Little Kool Barbie Erin Chrisman Goings NE
309 | Evs Diamond $1,600.00 | 00 M The Signature-Six Call Cash (DMNV Mountable) Donnie Bearden OK
310 | Make His Mark $800.00 | 07 G Teller Cartel-Lucks Gold Blowing W Ranch OK
311 | Agavi $15,000.00 | 06 M Ausual Suspect-Chelsie Lu (Tempting Dash) Sam Smith X
Corona Cartel-First Down Surfin (Feature Mr
312 [ Corona Curl $40,000.00 | 04 M Bojangles) Vincent P Genco CA
313 | Jess Tres $13,000.00 | 10 F Tres Seis-Jess Me Yall Post Oak Farms TX
314 | Sugar Lips $2,000.00 | 10 M Valid Expectations-Runs Naked (Foose) George Temple TX
315 | Rapid Dispatch 97 M Runaway Winner-Rapid Perks Withdrawn X
316 | Dashin Pana $8,500.00 | 01 M Toast To Dash-Panamas Tiny Jet Repurchase X
317 | Tikolino $2,000.00 | 05 M Raise Suzurun-Cara Nonne (Hard Hitting) Donnie Bearden OK
318 | Eyes Required $10,000.00 | 05 M Mr Eye Opener-Special Jelly Roll (Red Storm Cat) Charles Hainline OK
319 [ Lil Corona Swingin $1,500.00 | 11 F Swingin Jess-Corona Cerveza Delfino Morillon KS
320 | More Controversy $0.00 | 03 M Relagate-Love For Fun No Bid X
321 | Sassy Tina $4,000.00 | 11 F Wave Carver-Sassy Corona D & S Racing, LLC MS
322 [ Cute Ivory Girl 10 F Ivory James-Tres Cute Withdrawn KS
323 | Rosiesjessdelightful $5,000.00 | 12 F Stratospheric-Miss Smooth Leader Repurchase MO
324 | Dreaming Out Loud $3,200.00 | 99 M Mr Eye Opener-Dreams R Special (Favorite Cartel) Randal E. Schwartz ND
325 | Zoom In Fast $4,000.00 | 11 G Jess Zoomin-Shell Eye Your Cash Ramon Escamilla KY
326 [ Country Lights $6,500.00 | 10 F Chicks Regard-Sweet As Cash Mike Abraham NM
327 | Pricey Looks $4,500.00 | 05 M lllegal Runaway-Worthy Contender (Favorite Cartel) Randal E. Schwartz ND
328 [ Foal In Utero $10,000.00 ggB U One Famous Eagle-First Moon Risen Christine A. Hovey 1A
329 [ Cool N Sixy $700.00 | 98 M Imtoocool (TB)-Pass Six (Executive Menace) Randy Haffner IN
330 | Valiant Sonata $4,500.00 | 11 F Valiant Hero-Miss Stocks N Bonds Todd Antonuk X
331 | Party Like Charlie $3,700.00 | 10 F Chicks Regard-Watchin The Rain Jesus Garza TAMAULIPAS
332 | Jess Magic Sis 09 M Mr Jess Perry-Little Magic Sis (Copacorona Special) | Withdrawn X
333 | Especially Tricky $900.00 | 92 M Phone Trick (TB)-Especially Special Hector Valencia TX
334 [ Pleasant Punch $1,500.00 | 01 M Lac Ouimet-Toucan Punch (Zest Quest) Equi Tech Service Denise P. Cope OK
335 | Do You Love Lorona $25,000.00 | 10 F Corona Cartel-MLA Do You Love Me Vincent P Genco CA
336 | | BJamn $4,000.00 | 11 F Carters Cartel-Brushpopper Renee E. Spiller TX
337 | Realville $1,800.00 | 11 G Real Visions-Kitty D Ville Jacob & Tara Thompson X




No

338 | Super Fast Rogue $18,500.00 [ DOB G Heza Fast Dash-Miss Jess Rogue Repurchase LA
339 [ Prissy Sin $2,300.00 | 99 M Heza Fast Man-Blazin Sin (Man On The Move) Marshall S Wier NE
340 | Imperial Corona $12,000.00 | 10 C Corona Cartel-Ought To Be Famous Scott Friesenhahn TX
341 | Walk With Memories $7,500.00 | 10 M Walk Thru Fire-Memory Cartel Namgis Quarter Horses

342 | Rapid Magic Dispatch $3,000.00 | 10 G Shazoom-Rapid Dispatch Hector Valencia TX
343 | Deferred Fortune $5,500.00 | 11 C Carters Cartel-A Delightful Legacy South Fork Farms uT
344 [ She s The Ms $2,000.00 | 11 F Hawkinson-Sixes Ms Perry Jesus Garza TAMAULIPAS
345 | Calypso King 09 G King Of The Mall-Typical Leader Withdrawn KS
346 | PY Thats Why $6,500.00 | 08 G PYC Paint Your Wagon-Dashing Four Socks Toby Keeton TX
347 | Runaway Nights $1,700.00 | 07 M Runaway Colors-Paris Nights (Jess Marmeta) Repurchase NM
348 [ Eye Opening Win $4,500.00 | 04 M Mr Eye Opener-Kin To The Wind (Deal A Game) Abelardo F. Gallegos CHIH
349 | Foal In Utero $1,200.00 g(())B U Makin Moves-Goddess Artemis Repurchase CA
350 | Killer Looks $14,500.00 | 00 M Ronas Ryon-Cool Location (lvory James) Antonio Sanchez X
351 [ Note The Beduino $3,000.00 | 13 C No Secrets Here-Note The Chick Hans Peterson uT
352 | None As Classic $25,500.00 | 10 F Corona Cartel-None As Easy Lyon Ranch

353 [ Blushing Lady Bug $6,500.00 | 98 M Blushing Bug-Gonna Getta Gone (FDD Dynasty) Repurchase MO
354 | GW Tiny Tiger $1,200.00 | 02 M Royal Shake Em-Silky Plan D & S Racing, LLC MS
355 | Eye Am Inseperable $2,100.00 | 11 F Inseperable-Eye Thirty Five Jane Griffin OK
356 | Breaker Breaker 123 $20,000.00 | 11 C Tres Seis-Very Dashin 123 Cuadna Toros X
357 | Blazin Mean $6,000.00 | 11 F First Moonflash-Blazin Force Repurchase TX
358 [ Our Sassy Hero $4,500.00 | 11 F Valiant Hero-Enticilizeur Ralph Young MT
359 | SR Golddiggers $2,400.00 | 10 F FDD Dynasty-Splashin Champagne Manuel Martinez Zavala SON
360 [ Don Gibran $2,700.00 | 11 G Brookstone Bay-La Jolla Rocket Joe Rios X
361 | Foal In Utero $3,500.00 g(())B U Wave Carver-KGB Agent Anna Repurchase CA
362 | Bellaire $1,600.00 | 11 F Hawkinson-Dear Shakey s Frank Dena TX
363 | Lajollas Leading Lady $4,000.00 | 04 M Special Leader-Luxurious La Jolla (Jet Black Patriot) [ Abelardo F. Gallegos CHIH
364 | Flyin To Holland $12,500.00 | 02 M Holland Ease-Miss Concorde (Freighttrain B) Bill or Debbie Myers SD
365 | Dash To The Finish $10,000.00 | 02 M First Down Dash-Make A Run (Giorgino) Larry or Bonnie Blain uT
366 | Ally Kazaam $15,500.00 | 04 M Shazoom-Ally Bye Bye (Captain Courage) Connie Nobles TX
367 | Sucha Heroine $3,700.00 | 11 F Valiant Hero-Atsi Ricardo & Socorro Lopez KS
368 | The Magic Begins $1,000.00 | 94 M First Down Dash-Prissy Gold Digger Sog Horses and Cattle Houston Earl uT
369 [ Hot Little Secret 10 F Walk Thru Fire-Girl Secrets Withdrawn X
370 | Tempted By Ivory $3,000.00 | 11 C Ivory James-A Tempting Strawfly Tom Scheckel 1A
371 | Recital $5,000.00 | 01 M Corona Cartel-Easily A Doll Roger Crull TX
372 [ Fur Elise $1,800.00 | 02 M Ima Good Gamble-Sunny Thera (Stoli) Darrel Henry MO
373 | Flyin Legal $8,000.00 | 05 M lllegal Runaway-Copafly (Carters Cartel) Jerry D. Chapman TX
374 | Sheza Famous Lady $3,000.00 | 11 F One Famous Eagle-Sheza Stone Runner Aaron Harvey KS
375 [ Crystal Current $1,000.00 | 06 M Relagate-Dueling Maid (Divide The Cash) Repurchase GA




376 | Okie Belle $2,000.00 | 11 F Okey Dokey Dale-Eyesabelle Aaron Harvey KS
377 | Featuring Habits 10 C Feature Mr Jess-First Femme Withdrawn CA
378 | Foal In Utero $4,700.00 g(())B U Stoli-Silver Tongued Chick Alejandro Camou AZ
379 | Matagorda Bay $3,000.00 | 11 Brookstone Bay-Blond Cartel Repurchase X
380 | Misstify $2,500.00 | 10 F Tac It Like A Man-Nadica Tom Scheckel 1A
Strawfly Special-High Debonairess (High Rate Of
381 | Special Debonairess $4,500.00 | 04 M Return) Gary Hess PA
382 | Jazzing Cheree $5,500.00 | 99 M Jazzing Hi-Streakin Memories Sog Horses and Cattle Houston Earl uT
383 | Shadasha $7,500.00 | 11 F Shazoom-Dasha Easy Bryan Calloway AR
384 [ Shesabrimmer $1,800.00 | 11 F Brimmerton-Shes An Eye Opener s Frank Dena TX
385 | SV Dancing Cartel $1,800.00 | 13 F Cartel Success-Honey Danceme Loose M C Stucks OK
386 | Eyesa Darlin $5,500.00 | 09 M Eyesa Special-Corona Darlin (Tres Seis) Johnny Jones IlI TX
387 [ Dash To Honor $11,000.00 | 08 M Bully Bullion-Dash The Honor (Rolls Of Romance) Darling Farms Dan Darling OK
388 | Royal Valiance $3,200.00 | 11 G Valiant Hero-Royaltime Classic Jason & Leslie Willis SC
389 | Alteza $8,000.00 | 10 F Ocean Runaway-Its High Alex Baeza TX
390 | Purr D Chick $1,800.00 | 09 M Country Chicks Man-Purr D Cat (Furrtreeous) Sabra Ross OK
391 | Chicakiss $2,000.00 | 11 F Valiant Hero-PC Dashin Chic Fidencio Jimenez
392 | Fine Wines $56,000.00 | 00 M First Down Dash-Dashin Sandy MJ Farms NM
393 | Razzle Dazzle Cartel $1,300.00 | 10 F Jet Cartel-Razzle Dazzle Pistol Lynn Rollings SC
394 [ Cupids Signature $2,500.00 | 11 F Dean Miracle-Cupid Rules Scott Oliver SC
395 | Heroic Flight $3,000.00 | 11 F Valiant Hero-Miss Concorde ZACH STEVENSON TX
396 | Dominike $3,500.00 | 11 F Foose-Pure Dazzle Salome Gallegos
397 | Jessa Merlot $3,200.00 | 11 F Jesse James Jr-Marilyn Merlot Ralph Danard ALB
398 | Jess A Little Cash $10,000.00 | 99 M Mr Jess Perry-Cash And Music (FDD Dynasty) Mike Abraham NM
399 | My Bold Tres $3,200.00 | 11 C Tres Seis-Lil Sweet Minnie Walter Hanibal Jr. OK
400 [ Predictably $6,500.00 | 99 M Streakin La Jolla-Coincidentally (Fighter On Fire) Bonnie Percival NE
401 | Quick Lee Gayle 94 M Victory Dash-Quick Lee Bam Withdrawn TX
402 [ No Commitment $1,400.00 | 07 G Likenothinyoueversaw-Rarely Forever Kelsey Cooley X
403 [ Susie Showoff $5,700.00 | 10 F Country Chicks Man-Bosanova Baby Repurchase KS
404 | Azooming Turf $4,500.00 [ 10 G Azoom-Maddies Special Turf Linda L Maxwell 1A
405 | Sha Cha $1,400.00 | 02 M Shazoom-Sharber (Fishin CR) C. W. Mullenix IN
406 [ First Moon Risen $7,000.00 | 03 M First Down Dash-Moon Arisen CNN Breeding TX
Streakin La Jolla-Cute And Charming (Divide The
407 | Teefee $2,200.00 | 03 M Cash) Bonnie Percival NE
408 [ Mr Truly Uno 07 G Feature Mr Jess-Truley Yours Withdrawn TX
409 | First Blazin Love $73,500.00 | 09 C Chicks A Blazin-Love At First Glance Guillermo & Maria Valdivia OK
410 | Solid Magic Rock $1,300.00 | 11 F Rock Solid Jess-First Tinkerbell Lisa Kuhimann X
411 | lts High 97 M Is It True (TB)-Kiss Me High Withdrawn KY
412 | Kosmo Kate $10,700.00 | 03 M Stoli-Streakin Kate (Fantastic Corona Jr) Repurchase TX
413 | Awesome N Quick $2,000.00 | 09 M Awesome Chrome-Quick N Special Luis Miguel Albores Gleason FL




414 | Blue Da Boom $1,900.00 | 09 G Thors Bullion-GW Tiny Tiger Travis & Mindy Parr WI
415 | Tell $3,500.00 | 10 G Teller Cartel-Ally Kazaam Corner K Quarter Horses, LLC AR
416 [ Theroyalbigeasy $3,900.00 | 13 C Givinitaroyaleffort-Nancys Easy Womack / Cavender Farms X
417 | Rock Bass 09 G SC Chisled In Stone-Rushin Bullette Withdrawn 1A
418 | Ronas Sunshine $500.00 | 04 M Sunny Silence-Runaway Scrape (Tailgunner Tom) Blowing W Ranch OK
419 [ Runaway Cartel Cat $1,200.00 | 11 G Cartel Dancer-O Kitty Amanda Capps
420 [ Crystal Jade $4,500.00 | 07 M Stoli-Special Crys Jimmie Hatcher LA
First Smart Money-Secret Interlude (Country Chicks
421 | Dos Secretos $1,600.00 | 06 M Man) Marciano LeChuga X
422 | Three Past Six 05 M Tres Seis-Coincidentally (One Famous Eagle) Withdrawn NM
423 | Winning Dynasty $9,500.00 | 10 F FDD Dynasty-Winning Flair Lucky Charm Racing X
424 | Mombasa $9,000.00 | 10 F Johannesburg-Fearless Freda Riley Blanchet LA
425 | Night Deverano $1,800.00 | 11 F Jesse James Jr-Miss Corona Deverano Harvey Baeza X
426 | Scouts Wagon $9,900.00 | 10 F PYC Paint Your Wagon-Streaking Bunny Lyon Ranch
427 | Artesias Chcsbeduino $4,500.00 | 01 M Chicks Beduino-Artesia (Wave Carver) Terry Moody SD
428 | BV Jesse James $10,500.00 | 10 C Ivory James-Chicks Wanta Dash Oscar Padilla OK
429 | Where Eagles Soar $3,000.00 | 10 F One Famous Eagle-Sixy Thru Traffic Repurchase TX
430 | Blaze Carver 10 S Wave Carver-Blazin Fire Withdrawn OK
431 [ Dolla Dolla Bill $4,200.00 | 09 G Valiant Hero-None As Easy Copitzy Vazquez X
432 | Sendicate $27,000.00 | 13 C Separatist-Send Me The Candy Repurchase TX
433 | Ryon James $7,000.00 | 10 G Ilvory James-Yadazoom Juan Fernandez OK
434 | Oro Oak g(())B F Oak Tree Special-Plataoro Withdrawn X
435 | Foal In Utero $2,500.00 g%B U Fantastic Corona Jr-Mariah L Filimon Saucedo TX
436 | Brava Brava $13,000.00 | 01 M Corona Cartel-Cool Location (One Sweet Jess) Kimberly & Herman Hogue OK
437 | Bigtime Arragnement $2,500.00 | 11 G Bigtime Favorite-Jessies Arrangement Jason & Leslie Willis SC
438 [ Cowgirl Cartel $7,000.00 | 07 M Corona Cartel-Casual Slip Knot (Okey Dokey Dale) Copper Spring Ranch MONTANA
439 [ Satin Runaway $30,000.00 | 09 M Ocean Runaway-Send Me Satin (lvory James) Repurchase AZ
Fredricksburg-Shesmine N Shesroyal (Genuine
440 [ Eleven To Seven $7,500.00 | 07 M Strawfly) James G Murry, Jr X
441 | Just Stridin Ivory $7,500.00 | 11 G Ivory James-Just Wanna Be Me Repurchase ND
442 | Ata Fast Glance $3,800.00 | 04 M Heza Fast Man-Down Town Miss (Pappasito) Johnny Sanchez
443 | Eye M A Hero $2,000.00 | 11 G Valiant Hero-Eye Opener Bentley David Brown OK
Sixarun-Sweetheart Stones (PYC Paint Your
444 | Sweethearts Quicksix $27,000.00 | 99 M Wagon) Marshall S Wier NE
445 [ Brookstone Forever $3,200.00 | 11 F Brookstone Bay-Bit Happens Jason & Leslie Willis SC
446 | Streakin Lil Sis $7,500.00 | 11 F Streakin Six-Caralot Scott Reid ONT
447 | Painted Silk $14,000.00 | 03 M Stoli-Arctic Silk Chad Hart GA
448 | Miz Corona Up $3,500.00 | 11 F Corona Up-This Chicks A Ruler Jim & Gene Ann Dreyer Trust TX
449 [ Tilghman C $5,000.00 | 09 G Check Him Out-Three Times Four Repurchase KS
450 | Famous Apollo $2,200.00 | 10 F Jesse James Jr-Apollo Princess Terry Moody SD




451 | Nahvi $2,800.00 | 10 F Teller Cartel-Bourbonstreetchick Valentin Arellanes X
452 | Jumpn To A Fortune $7,200.00 | 10 F Tres Fortunes-Eyesa Jumpn D & S Racing, LLC MS
453 | Teller Im Here $3,500.00 | 11 G Teller Cartel-Rev It Down Jason & Leslie Willis SC
454 | Charming Cartel $34,000.00 | 11 F Corona Cartel-Miss Kips Streakin Blowing W Ranch OK
455 | Foal In Utero $1,500.00 g(())B U Pappasito-Three Green Leaves Repurchase CA
456 [ Chumlee $4,200.00 | 09 G Stoli-Looselips Sink Ships Copitzy Vazquez TX
457 | Allies Cashin In $4,700.00 | 11 F Tres Seis-A Dash Of Gray D & S Racing, LLC MS
458 | Poetic License $3,100.00 | 05 M Aldebaran-Avian Eden (Captain Courage) Norman M. Yoder IL
459 [ Ivory Jade $10,700.00 | 11 F Ivory James-Newport Lily Renee E. Spiller TX
460 | Shez At Home $2,700.00 | 99 M Rare Form-Jettin Home Jennifer Nabors MO
461 [ Wave By By $7,200.00 | 11 F Wave Carver-Baja Luna Larry Bain 1A
462 | Lucky Star 123 $8,500.00 | 11 F FDD Dynasty-Barbs Beduino 123 Alvin Lee Turner TX
463 | Queen Of Everything 96 M Coup De Kas (TB)-Copy Six (Apollitical Jess) Withdrawn MO
464 [ Fishin Injun $2,200.00 | 10 G Fishin Kisses-A Lil Known Tribe Myrl Alan Tibbitts X
465 | Foal In Utero $3,000.00 g(())B U Shining First Dash-Denim N Dimples Repurchase MO
466 | Homesick Gypsy 10 G Carters Cartel-Threadbare Gypsysoul Withdrawn TX
467 | Coronas Bank $2,500.00 | 09 M Corona Caliente-Beduinos Bank (Jess Marmeta) Repurchase NM
468 | Two Fisted Sister $7,000.00 | 07 M Dash Thru Traffic-Beduinos Bug (Teller Cartel) Repurchase OK
469 | Mr Pipeline $5,700.00 | 11 G One Famous Eagle-Little Surfer Ramon R Vega TX
470 [ Miss Smooth Leader 95 M Special Leader-Holme Smooth Withdrawn MO
471 | Valiant Libby $7,500.00 | 09 M Valiant Hero-Libbys Cartel (Inseperable) Salome Gallegos

472 | Miss Double Excel $3,200.00 | 10 F Volcom-Big Fisher Ramon R Vega X
473 | Wingalicious $5,000.00 | 10 M Tres Seis-Winga (Apollitical Jess) South Fork Farms uT
474 | Huntin Ivory $6,000.00 | 10 G Ivory James-Baja Rosa Greg or Kim Gill AR
475 | Littel Fire La Jolla $9,000.00 | 06 M Walk Thru Fire-Chick La Jolla (Jet Black Patriot) Lance & Megan Powers OK
476 | lll Run For Her $9,200.00 | 09 M Ocean Runaway-Eyes Hungry (Executive Menace) D & S Racing, LLC MS
477 | What Gives $8,000.00 | 10 G Ivory James-Special And Genuine Jesse Godinez CA
478 | Dash With Jody 08 M Jody O Toole-Dolly With Dash (Had To Be Nuts) Withdrawn TX
479 | St Elmoe $4,700.00 | 11 G Wood Bridge-Boot Scootin Beverly Casey Crowther FL
480 [ Krystal Clear $1,300.00 | 11 F Gold Medal Jess-Secret Interlude Manuela Martinez TX
481 | Foal In Utero $1,000.00 g(())B U Pappasito-Silver Tongued Chick Marciano LeChuga X
482 | BV Ms Pappasito $2,000.00 | 11 F Pappasito-Ms Tres Seis Jason & Leslie Willis SC
483 [ Runnin Naked $17,000.00 | 10 F First Down Dash-Runs Naked Repurchase CcO
484 | Miss Confident Jody $2,000.00 | 01 M Jody O Toole-Miss Confident Air (Tac It Like A Man) [ Sharp, John/Muniz, Janessa TX
485 | Shazoomscheerleader $4,000.00 | 11 F Shazoom-Kermits Cheerleader James L Johnson OK
486 | Captivant 10 F Tinys First Corona-Eyes Required Withdrawn OK
487 | Stel Rare $3,200.00 | 10 F Stel Corona-Rare Encore Gerardo Martinez MO
488 | Wave Crusher $5,400.00 | 13 C Wave Carver-Send Me The Candy Johnny Sanchez




489 [ Shake Em N Win $4,000.00 | 01 M Royal Shake Em-Dream N Win (Man On The Move) Tyler Hoxeng SD
490 [ DD Toast To Romance $2,500.00 | 05 M Toast To Dash-Romance Writer (Jess Zoomin) Noe Villarreal X
491 [ Brite Chocolate Chip $4,000.00 | 04 M Zips Chocolate Chip-Bright Kania Chad Hart GA
492 | BP Southern Policy $17,000.00 | 06 M Heza Fast Man-Southern Policy (lvory James) Reliance Ranches, LLC OK
493 | SV Ronas Cartel $2,000.00 | 13 C Cartel Success-High Density Robert C. Williams Jr OK
494 | Chamisas Fire $20,000.00 | 10 M Walk Thru Fire-Chicks Chamisa (First Moonflash) Melvin Neugebauer CcO
495 | La Jollaroid $15,000.00 | 02 S Streakin La Jolla-Miss Dasheroid Johnny Sanchez

496 | Eysa Gone $700.00 | 03 M Eyesa Special-Aftertheloveisgone Dave Hermanson ND
497 | Very Dashin 123 $10,000.00 | 04 M Dash Thru Traffic-Very Striking (Swingin Jess) Copper Spring Ranch MONTANA
498 | Ilwannatacaboutme $3,500.00 | 10 C Tac It Like A Man-Shes A Strawfly Gerardo Martinez MO
499 | BP Wave Chick $4,200.00 | 08 M Wave Carver-Holland Chickie Abelardo F. Gallegos CHIH
500 [ Freak On A Leash $1,000.00 | 11 G RN Docter Pepper-RG Stolis Kiss Darling Farms Dan Darling OK
501 | High Density $0.00 | 92 M Ronas Ryon-Top Level (TB) No Bid LA
502 | Tecate Sizzle $4,000.00 | 09 M Coronas Prospect-Teesetta Dixie Hinkle TX
503 | JC Dont Blink $3,000.00 | 08 M Brimmerton-Sixes Ms Perry (Freighttrain B) Scott Friesenhahn TX
504 | Eyes First Class $7,700.00 | 10 F First Down Dash-Eyes Hungry Chad Hart GA
505 | Lil Bit Leader $22,000.00 | 07 M Special Leader-Lil Bit Rusty (Wave Carver) Chad Hart GA
506 | TF Strawflyin Hawk $2,000.00 | 11 G Hawkinson-Flying Legal Ruben Flores IL
507 [ Foal In Utero $4,000.00 g(())B U Brookstone Bay-Answer The Dream Robert or Julie Petersen MN
508 [ Jody To The Ritz 11 G Jodys Money Pop-Takin On The Ritz Withdrawn X
509 | CC Dashing Diva $2,000.00 | 10 F Dashin Is Easy-Adrianna Erin Jason & Leslie Willis SC
510 [ Royale Cartel 11 C Corona Cartel-Royalista Withdrawn X
511 | Fabulous Strawfly $3,200.00 | 06 M Genuine Strawfly-Fabulous Results Salome Gallegos

512 [ Red Solo Cupp $2,200.00 | 11 F Ketel Won-Salty Broad Silvergate Farms Vick Vernon TX
513 | Leader In Fashion $4,200.00 | 11 G Okey Dokey Dale-Yours Til Dawn Jose Angel Burringa OK
514 | Louisiana Jane B $1,700.00 | 10 F Panther Mountain-Three Royal Roses Travis & Mindy Parr WI
515 | | Lost My Wine $800.00 | 06 M Ausual Suspect-Dressed For Cash (View Me Flying) | John Sharp TX
516 [ Sheza Classic Tango $1,200.00 | 11 F Torrid Tango-Shamrocks Classic Jim & Gene Ann Dreyer Trust TX
517 | Send Bad 13 C Tres Seis-Send Me The Candy Withdrawn TX
518 | Johnnie Dale $3,500.00 | 11 G Okey Dokey Dale-Im Never Ever Sober Keith Newberg MN
519 [ CC Dynasty $10,000.00 | 09 M FDD Dynasty-Corona Coquette (Freighttrain B) Tate Farms, Agent LA
520 | Corona Fantasy $37,000.00 | 08 M Corona Cartel-Fontanas Fantasy (FDD Dynasty) Terry & Irene Stennett X
521 | Alice Coachman $4,500.00 | 11 F Swingin Jess-Three Green Leaves Kelly, J. Garvan / Yearsley, Nancy CA
522 | BB Milliondollarbaby $12,500.00 | 10 F Valiant Hero-Stoli N Me Tony Cunningham MI
523 | El Jackal 11 G Fishin Kisses-Sha Cha Withdrawn X
524 | Southern Corona $95,000.00 | 01 S Corona Cartel-Southern Policy Ramon R Vega X
525 | Unnamed Weanling 13 F Hard Hitting-Heavenly Powder Withdrawn NC
526 [ Heavenly Powder 94 M Takin On The Cash-Sweeter Than Pie (Hard Hitting) [ Withdrawn NC
527 | Cool Hand Azoom $2,300.00 | 09 G Azoom-Shesa Special Hand David Wilkerson OK




528 | Miss Racy First Down $33,000.00 | 10 F First Down Dash-Runaway Vike Terry & Irene Stennett X
Jess Louisiana Blue-Fearless Freda (High Rate Of
529 [ Freda Blue $24,000.00 | 08 M Return) Tate Farms, Agent LA
530 | Favorite Nemo 11 G Finding Nemo-Favorite Energy Withdrawn CcO
Royal Quick Dash-Baby Runaway (Fantastic Corona
531 [ Attitude Boy $7,500.00 | 06 M Jr) Joe Bysong 0K
532 [ Miracle Fish 11 F Fishin Kisses-Miracle Hock Withdrawn X
533 | Adios Amiga Mia $5,700.00 | 01 M Chicks Beduino-Say Bye Bye (Favorite Cartel) Johnny Sanchez
534 [ Distenedtobewild $4,500.00 | 09 M FDD Dynasty-Wild Six Myers, Brandon & Shelby OK
535 | Justa Lil Jellybean $8,500.00 | 00 M Marthas Six Moons-Lady Zevi Vickie Adams X
536 [ Wave Three Times $4,000.00 | 09 M Wave Carver-Corona Three (Teller Cartel) Larry H. Hughes CO
537 | Swagger Otoole $5,000.00 | 11 G Valiant Hero-Miss O Toole Jacob & Tara Thompson X
538 | Miss Avery Kay $4,000.00 | 05 M Southern Cartel-Stardust Dash (Captain Courage) D & S Racing, LLC MS
539 [ V Os Red Hot Cole g(())B G PYC Paint Your Wagon-Miss Eyewear Withdrawn MN
540 | Pretty Cartel $2,000.00 | 11 F Cartel Dancer-Chicks Pretty In Red Sharp, John/Muniz, Janessa TX
541 [ Tyme For A Corona $15,000.00 | 10 G Corona Cartel-First Prize Honey Cindy Keeton X
542 | Wreckless Dean $1,800.00 | 09 G Dean Miracle-Reckless Storm Leonel Garza TX
543 [ Denim N Dimples $1,000.00 | 97 M The Desert Jewel-Dimple Bug Johnny Sanchez
544 [ Fast Fishin Cash $3,200.00 | 09 G Ivory James-It Rains Fishes Robert L Gordon X
545 | Well Coordinated $2,000.00 | 01 M Coordinator-Royal Tantrum (Capo de Capi) Repurchase OK
546 | Zizzle $5,200.00 | 10 F Ivory James-Special Phebe Bill or Debbie Myers SD
547 | Oceans Of Bliss $5,000.00 | 10 F QOcean Runaway-Bits Of Bliss Salome Gallegos
548 | Afrashad $6,000.00 | 02 S Smoke Glacken-Flo White Terrill & Bonnie Gibbs uTt
549 | GCH All Furr Me $3,000.00 | 10 G Furrtreeous-GCH Miss Sweet Foot Tara Woodall TX
550 [ Foal In Utero $5,000.00 B%B U No Secrets Here-Sheza Fast Habit Vaughn M. Cook CO
551 | La Jolla Pena $3,500.00 | 02 M Streakin La Jolla-Holly Pena (Divide The Cash) Chad Ward OK
552 | Bagotti $6,000.00 | 11 F Okey Dokey Dale-Miss Brd Jacob & Tara Thompson X
553 [ Same OId Trick $7,000.00 | 08 M Favorite Trick-Stardust Dash (Hiclass La Jolla) Steve Holt OK
554 | Unquestionable $41,000.00 | 09 M Oak Tree Special-Real Or Imagined Robicheaux Ranch, Inc., Agent LA
555 | One Famous Racy Lady $15,500.00 | 10 F One Famous Eagle-Buckshot Delight Repurchase CcO
556 [ Salty Dogg $3,700.00 | 11 G Ketel Won-Salty Shay Scott Oliver SC
557 | Real Goodbye Jet $850.00 | 98 M Real Easy Jet-Ms Goodbye (Zest Quest) Johnny Sanchez
558 [ Silky Oak $3,700.00 | 08 M Hawkinson-Protea (Wave Carver) Frank McKay MANITOBA
559 | Honi Streakin $2,200.00 | 98 M Streakin Six-Toast N Honi Marca Sino Racing Horses TX
First Down Dash-Check It To Em Miss (Carters
560 [ Checkher A Firstdown $55,000.00 | 03 M Cartel) George Wilcox AR
561 | First Down An Te $2,100.00 | 11 G Down N Dash-An Te Gilbert Lynn Rollings SC
562 | Privileged Cartel $6,200.00 | 08 M Check Him Out-Immortal Cartel Ramon R Vega TX
563 | Foal In Utero $3,000.00 g(())B U Fade To Fame-Valdarama Repurchase CA
564 | Jess Scared Money 08 G Mr Jess Perry-No Fees Withdrawn X




565 | Valerianos Lady $2,900.00 | 09 M First Wrangler-Jetting Sis (Jodys Money Pop) Ramon R Vega TX
This Snow Is Royal-Sweethearts Quicksix (One
566 | Snow Burn $68,000.00 | 05 M Dashing Eagle) Debra Laney NM
567 | Centercurlincash $7,000.00 | 11 F Spit Curl Jess-Centers Takin Cash Repurchase CcO
568 | Adrians Jolla $12,500.00 | 03 S Streakin La Jolla-High Fashion Lass Myers, Brandon & Shelby OK
569 | BP Tadpole $11,500.00 | 10 F First Down Dash-A Cartel Fling Chad Hart GA
570 | JLS Featurethisdance $13,000.00 | 06 M Feature Mr Jess-Dancing Tonight (Tee Cos) Tate Farms, Agent LA
571 | Dat Lil Dancer $4,200.00 | 01 M Lil Easy Cash-My Tru Dancer (Divide The Cash) Riley Blanchet LA
572 [ Airizon 09 M Tale Of The Cat-Fearless Chick Withdrawn KY
573 | Icy In The Morn $55,000.00 | 08 M First Down Dash-lcy Morn (Carters Cartel) Vincent P Genco CA
574 | Eye A Hero $6,200.00 | 10 G Valiant Hero-Ms Eyelene Rachuan Suarez MVZ VERACRUZ
575 | Ammo $2,500.00 | 11 C Jess Zoomin-Princess Sixarun Jason & Leslie Willis SC
576 [ Tellem Its Texas $3,700.00 | 09 G Teller Cartel-Jennifer Kate Jose Ines Serna X
577 | Oak Cask $1,500.00 | 11 F Qak Tree Special-Sensational Snow Ricardo & Socorro Lopez KS
578 | My Magic Perry $3,200.00 | 10 G Jonathan Perry-JJ Flyin Magic Tara Woodall X
579 | Fleetwood Maxx $2,200.00 | 13 C Brookstone Bay-Stevie Six Mike Abraham NM
580 | Quick Colors $2,500.00 | 05 M Runaway Colors-Mighty Quick Call (Jess Marmeta) Repurchase NM
581 [ Dales Sis $3,700.00 | 10 F Okey Dokey Dale-My Native Sis Flying W Ranch David Witcher X
582 | Nikki Nine $2,500.00 | 03 M Nineeleven-Penikese (Hard Hitting) West Wind Oilfield Services Alex Kirkpatric | AB
583 [ So Into Me 13 F Oak Tree Special-Send Me The Candy Withdrawn X
584 | Sc Jessica $1,700.00 | 08 M Fly Jess Fly-Skye Command (Pappasito) Sog Horses and Cattle Houston Earl uT
585 | Made For Romance $8,200.00 | 11 F Azoom-Ima Ramblin Girl Johnny Sanchez
586 | Fast Jeans $28,000.00 | 02 M Strawflyin Buds-Pleezum (One Famous Eagle) Tom Scheckel 1A
587 | Boonsville Dream $500.00 | 91 M Dashing Investment-Rocket Dreams Pat Helton TX
588 [ Foal In Utero $4,500.00 g(())B U Ocean Runaway-Painted Silk Gary L. Muller MO
589 | Royal Blue Mama $4,000.00 | 10 F PYC Paint Your Wagon-Royal Blue Heart ZACH STEVENSON TX
590 | Tailgunner Kate $700.00 | 10 F Tailgunner Tom-Teesetta Elferrelaureano Broom OK
591 | Ravinly $8,500.00 | 10 F Valiant Hero-Jessica Raven Vincent P Genco CA
592 | Toms Dashing Bunny $3,900.00 | 10 F Tailgunner Tom-Fast Fast Bunny Rachuan Suarez MVZ VERACRUZ
593 [ Shakenbake Perry $2,300.00 | 10 F Johnathan Perry-Shakemandzoom Elferrelaureano Broom OK
594 | Summer Buzz $3,200.00 | 11 F Carters Cartel-A Special lllusion Bryan Hawks X
595 [ Austinero $4,100.00 | 11 G Game Patriot-Austiana William Valencia NM
596 | Renae Nicole $2,700.00 | 11 F Mr Eye Opener-A Luxury ltem David Hoxeng SD
597 | BR Razr $5,000.00 | 11 G Gold Medal Jess-Lady Dee Vee Em Joe Rios X
598 | Oh Look At Me $0.00 | 97 M Oh Shiney-Brazos Bunny No Bid X
599 | Sugar Snap Pea $6,000.00 | 05 M Truley First Class-Moses Pea (Captain Courage) Repurchase TX
600 | Ahmen Algonquine Also $1,000.00 | 07 M Brimmerton-Algonquin Pamela K Ireland OK
601 | Navigatrix $3,500.00 | 97 M Star De Naskar-Methodical (Hard Hitting) Dena Todd X
602 | Lofty $15,000.00 | 10 F Valiant Hero-El Streaker Tom Scheckel 1A
603 [ Mito Fire 11 G Walk Thru Fire-Prima Ld Withdrawn X




First Down Dash-Dasha Freda (Coronas Leaving

604 | Fast Dashin Freda $22,000.00 | 09 M You) Vincent P Genco CA
605 | Just Wanna Corona 10 ggnder Stel Corona-Just Wanna Be Me Withdrawn X
606 | Thebaldnthebeautiful $6,000.00 | 11 F Carters Cartel-A Chick Of Class Womack / Cavender Farms TX
607 | Peppermint Seis $8,500.00 | 06 M Tres Seis-Rare Peppermint Mark D Rigby DVM X
608 [ Screamn For Vengence $3,500.00 | 11 G Walk Thru Fire-High Fuel Cartel Jesse Godinez CA
609 | The Original Sin $20,000.00 | 04 M First Down Dash-Rarely Sinful (Jess Louisiana Blue) | Copper Spring Ranch MONTANA
610 | Naketa $8,500.00 | 09 M PYC Paint Your Wagon-Bryans Show Girl Amy Schimke SD
611 | Send Me The Candy $48,000.00 | 94 M Leaving Memories-Send Me Candy Brian Gunder OH
612 | Jess Say Win $7,500.00 | 08 M Feature Mr Jess-Ms Baggett Kimberly & Herman Hogue OK
613 | Mister Motor $9,000.00 | 08 S Mr Eye Opener-Strawflyin Devil Hans Peterson uT
614 | Arctic Winner $30,000.00 | 07 M First Down Dash-Arctic Silk (One Famous Eagle) Terry & Irene Stennett TX
This Snow Is Royal-Ladys A Special Star (Captain
615 | Sensational Snow $7,000.00 | 04 M Courage) Salome Gallegos
616 | Mypassionsspeed 11 G FDD Dynasty-A Blast of Fast Withdrawn X
617 [ Shiney Ivory $6,000.00 | 10 F Ivory James-Shine N Shake Brandi Crowe CO
618 | Trick Or Bounty $2,500.00 | 07 M Favorite Trick-Sparkling Bounty (Hard Hitting) Donnie Bearden OK
619 | R Dustys Fury $23,000.00 | 11 F Furyofthewind-RSpecial Chick Womack / Cavender Farms TX
620 [ Dash N Way $5,700.00 | 09 M Mr Eye Opener-Mimi Scooter (Desirio) Ralph Danard ALB
621 | Truck To Waves $2,000.00 | 10 G Wave Carver-Forced To Win Gerardo Martinez MO
622 | Dos Poruno Share 02 S Mr Eye Opener-Send Me Satin Withdrawn TX
623 | Cute N Rimen $5,700.00 | 99 M Major Rime-Cute N Streakin (High Rate Of Return) Marshall S Wier NE
624 | Flaming Regard $4,700.00 | 10 F Walk Thru Fire-First Regards Johnny Sanchez
625 | Okey Runanway $900.00 | 09 M Okey Dokey Dale-Runaway Strawfly Myers, Brandon & Shelby OK
626 | Corona Cash Rose $2,200.00 | 05 M Corona Caliente-Tiny First Effort Robert Van Crowell TX
627 | Chicks Toast $6,000.00 | 09 M Toast To Dash-Chick La Jolla (Jet Black Patriot) Salome Gallegos
628 | Executive Game $10,000.00 | 08 M Executive Menace-Sticky N Picky (Captain Courage) | Johnny Sanchez
629 | Jumpstart Jess $20,000.00 | 10 F Mr Jess Perry-Jump Down First Vincent P Genco CA
630 | Glory Be Able $1,300.00 | 11 F Onthewingsofglory-I Am Able Oscar Munoz NE
631 [ BT Sookie Corona $4,900.00 | 09 F King Corona-Ah Sookie Danny Garcia NM
Special Leader-Stranger To Shame (Jess Louisiana
632 [ Shopaholic Sister $3,500.00 | 09 M Blue) Salome Gallegos
633 | Loves Heroes $7,000.00 | 10 F Valiant Hero-MLA Do You Love Me Valentin R Luna TN
634 | Poppy Hill $4,500.00 | 05 M Ought To Be Famous-Do Run De Run Abelardo F. Gallegos CHIH
635 | All So Easy $1,700.00 | 99 M Holland Ease-Also A High Marca Sino Racing Horses X
636 [ Royal Tiny O Toole $3,100.00 | 05 M Jody O Toole-Simple Signature (Tac It Like A Man) Eddie Webb IN
637 | Foal In Utero $17,500.00 g(())B U One Sweet Jess-Onemoreglassofwine Kimberly & Herman Hogue OK
638 [ Down To My Chickies 10 F Carters Cartel-First Down Chicky Withdrawn SD
639 | Chicks Got Looks $4,200.00 | 11 F Valiant Hero-Uncommonly Perry Jacob & Tara Thompson TX
640 | All About Fendi B $700.00 | 11 F Brimmerton-Unveiled Amanda Capps




641 | Red As A Rose 05 M Heza Bold Man-Sandys Fame (Fantastic Corona Jr) | Withdrawn TX
642 | Winga $7,000.00 | 05 M Holland Ease-Holliewood Hopes (Captain Courage) Alvarez Racing, LLC Luis A Alvarez CA
643 | Jess Dash On $15,500.00 | 03 M Mr Jess Perry-Dash Back To Me (Heza Fast Dash) Abelardo F. Gallegos CHIH
644 [ Sheza Fast Habit 08 M Heza Fast Dash-Sheza Habit (FDD Dynasty) Withdrawn CA
645 [ Cowgirl Folly $5,000.00 | 10 F Separatist-Sixes Folley Ramon R Vega TX
646 | Social Wildcat $1,000.00 | 00 M Forest Wildcat-Southern Etiquett (View Me Flying) Joe Merrick OK
647 | Skipping Eyes $6,000.00 | 00 M Mr Eye Opener-Skipping North (Carters Cartel) Repurchase TX
648 | Ms TNT 08 M Corona Cartel-Honor And Cherish Withdrawn SD
649 [ Oh Honey Hush $2,500.00 | 93 M Rare Jet-Go Go Native Norman M. Yoder IL
650 | Stormin Thru $2,700.00 | 11 G Red Storm Cat-Dash Thru Diva Oscar Munoz NE
Takin On The Cash-Easily Soothed (Sweet First

651 [ Jocelyns Easy Cash 96 M Down) Withdrawn OK
652 | Jumpn Jessie $12,700.00 | 07 M Jumpn-Jess A Little Cash (No Secrets Here) Ramon R Vega TX
653 | Welcome Back B 10 C Carters Cartel-Just Remember This Withdrawn OK
654 [ Streakin Moonlight $13,500.00 | 00 M Streakin Six-Moonlight Dasher (FDD Dynasty) Chad Hart GA
655 | Magic Scoop Vieja $550.00 | 05 M Magic Scoop-My Otra Vieja (Zest Quest) Silvergate Farms Vick Vernon X
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